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Almost fifteen years after the end of the Cold War, the process of creating a "Europe whole and free" is
incomplete and likely to be so for the foreseeable future. In this volume, a group of highly distinguished
contributors from both East and West examines the complicated and multi-faceted process of NATO and EU
enlargement in the context of the changed global situation since the terrorist attacks of September 11, 2001.
This book examines the enlargement processes not only from the perspective of the West and western
institutions, but also from the point of view of the former communist countries. If an enlarged NATO and
EU are to be stable and successful in the long run, they must take account of the wishes and interests of both
their new, former-communist members and those European states that will not become members of either
NATO or the EU in the foreseeable future Contributors include Christopher Bobinski (Unia & Polska),
Vladimir Baranovsky (Institute of the World Economy and International Relations), Heather Grabbe (Center
for European Reform), Karl-Heinz Kamp (Konrad Adenauer Foundation), Charles King (Georgetown
University), Alexander J. Motyl (Center for Global Change and Governance), Zaneta Ozolina (University of
Latvia), Alexander Sergounin (Nizhny Novgorod Linguistic University), William Wallace (London School
of Economics), and Leonid Zaiko (Strategy Center).
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From reader reviews:

Gilbert Kimmel:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and
notice by simply surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. Yep, by reading a guide your ability to survive improve then having chance to stay than other is
high. For you personally who want to start reading any book, we give you this specific Ambivalent
Neighbors: The EU, NATO and the Price of Membership book as basic and daily reading e-book. Why,
because this book is usually more than just a book.

Ruth Vigue:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading behavior give you
lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the book in
which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of guide you
read, if you want attract knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want really feel happy read one
with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Often the Ambivalent Neighbors: The EU, NATO and
the Price of Membership is kind of e-book which is giving the reader capricious experience.

Stacia Cobb:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and
soon. You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended for you is Ambivalent Neighbors: The EU, NATO and the Price of Membership this guide
consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now. This book was represented just how can
the world has grown up. The dialect styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. Often
the writer made some study when he makes this book. This is why this book suitable all of you.

Alice Weaver:

Is it you actually who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Ambivalent Neighbors: The EU,
NATO and the Price of Membership can be the solution, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are thus
out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
guides have than the others?
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