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Not since Robert McNamara has a secretary of defense been so hated by the military and derided by the
public, yet played such a critical role in national security policy with such disastrous results.

Donald Rumsfeld was a natural for secretary of defense, a position he'd already occupied once before. He
was smart. He worked hard. He was skeptical of the status quo in military affairs and dedicated to high-tech
innovations. He seemed the right man at the right time-but history was to prove otherwise.

Now Dale Herspring, a political conservative and lifelong Republican, offers a nonpartisan assessment of
Rumsfeld's impact on the U.S. military establishment from 2001 to 2006, focusing especially on the Iraq
War-from the decision to invade through the development and execution of operational strategy and the
enormous failures associated with the postwar reconstruction of Iraq.

Extending the critique of civil-military relations he began in The Pentagon and the Presidency, Herspring
highlights the relationship between the secretary and senior military leadership, showing how Rumsfeld and
a handful of advisers notably Paul Wolfowitz and Douglas Feith manipulated intelligence and often ignored
the military in order to implement their policies. And he demonstrates that the secretary's domineering
leadership style and trademark arrogance undermined his vision for both military transformation and Iraq.

Herspring shows that, contrary to his public deference to the generals, Rumsfeld dictated strategy and
operations sometimes even tactics to prove his transformation theories. He signed off on abolishing the Iraqi
army, famously refused to see the need for a counterinsurgency plan, and seemed more than willing to
tolerate the torture of prisoners. Meanwhile, the military became demoralized and junior officers left in
droves.

Rumsfeld's Wars revisits and reignites the concept of "arrogance of power," once associated with our dogged
failure to understand the true nature of a tragic war in Southeast Asia. It provides further evidence that
success in military affairs is hard to achieve without mutual respect between civilian authorities and military
leaders and offers a definitive case study in how not to run the office of secretary of defense.
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From reader reviews:

Leta Welter:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they're still students or that for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby per other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't want
do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Rumsfeld's Wars: The Arrogance of
Power (Modern War Studies) (Modern War Studies (Hardcover)). All type of book are you able to see on
many resources. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Marie Gambino:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the title Rumsfeld's Wars:
The Arrogance of Power (Modern War Studies) (Modern War Studies (Hardcover)) suitable to you? The
particular book was written by popular writer in this era. Often the book untitled Rumsfeld's Wars: The
Arrogance of Power (Modern War Studies) (Modern War Studies (Hardcover))is the main one of several
books this everyone read now. This specific book was inspired many men and women in the world. When
you read this publication you will enter the new age that you ever know prior to. The author explained their
strategy in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to understand the core of this book. This book
will give you a wide range of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world
in this particular book.

John Cleveland:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside having friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV the entire day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It ok you can
have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Rumsfeld's Wars: The Arrogance
of Power (Modern War Studies) (Modern War Studies (Hardcover)) which is finding the e-book version. So ,
try out this book? Let's view.

Geraldine Matson:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many problem for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people likes
examining, not only science book but additionally novel and Rumsfeld's Wars: The Arrogance of Power
(Modern War Studies) (Modern War Studies (Hardcover)) or perhaps others sources were given
understanding for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel want to read more and more.
Science book was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to
increase their knowledge. In various other case, beside science publication, any other book likes Rumsfeld's
Wars: The Arrogance of Power (Modern War Studies) (Modern War Studies (Hardcover)) to make your



spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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