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A Comprehensive, Thorough Introduction to High-Speed Networking Technologies and Protocols

Network Infrastructure and Architecture: Designing High-Availability Networks takes a unique approach to
the subject by covering the ideas underlying networks, the architecture of the network elements, and the
implementation of these elements in optical and VLSI technologies. Additionally, it focuses on areas not
widely covered in existing books: physical transport and switching, the process and technique of building
networking hardware, and new technologies being deployed in the marketplace, such as Metro Wave
Division Multiplexing (MWDM), Resilient Packet Rings (RPR), Optical Ethernet, and more.

Divided into five succinct parts, the book covers:

Optical transmission●

Networking protocols●

VLSI chips●

Data switching●

Networking elements and design●

Complete with case studies, examples, and exercises throughout, the book is complemented with chapter
goals, summaries, and lists of key points to aid readers in grasping the material presented.

Network Infrastructure and Architecture offers professionals, advanced undergraduates, and graduate
students a fresh view on high-speed networking from the physical layer perspective.
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From reader reviews:

John Harris:

Book is actually written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a book.
Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important issue to bring us around the world. Next
to that you can your reading talent was fluently. A book Network Infrastructure and Architecture: Designing
High-Availability Networks will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel more confidence if you can
know about every thing. But some of you think which open or reading a new book make you bored. It is not
necessarily make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or ideal book
with you?

Phillip Chadwick:

The reason? Because this Network Infrastructure and Architecture: Designing High-Availability Networks is
an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap that but latter it will surprise you with
the secret that inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who also write the book in such
remarkable way makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the
meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This
amazing book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book include such as help improving your
expertise and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I had been you I
will go to the reserve store hurriedly.

Sherri King:

This Network Infrastructure and Architecture: Designing High-Availability Networks is great e-book for you
because the content that is certainly full of information for you who always deal with world and have to
make decision every minute. This book reveal it data accurately using great organize word or we can declare
no rambling sentences within it. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole information in it.
Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but challenging core information with beautiful
delivering sentences. Having Network Infrastructure and Architecture: Designing High-Availability
Networks in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say
that no reserve that offer you world in ten or fifteen moment right but this e-book already do that. So , it is
good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt this?

Johanna Land:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got college students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And
also you know that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to understand
that reading is very important along with book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to provide you
knowledge, except your teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update with regards to something by



book. Many kinds of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is niagra Network
Infrastructure and Architecture: Designing High-Availability Networks.
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