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Did New Left activists have an opportunity to start a revolution that they simply could not bring off? Was
their rejection of conventional forms of political organization a fatal flaw or were the apparent weaknesses of
the movement -- the lack of central authority, the distrust of politics -- actually hidden strengths?

Wini Breines traces the evolution of the New Left movement through the Free Speech Movement, Students
for a Democratic Society (SDS), and SDS's community organization projects. For Breines, the movement's
goal of participatory decision-making, even when it was not achieved, made up for its failure to take
practical and direct action. By the late 1960s, antiwar activism contributed to the decline of the New Left, as
the movement was flooded with new participants who did not share the founding generation's political
experiences or values.

Originally published in 1982, Wini Breines's classic work now includes a new preface in which she
reassesses, and for the most part affirms, her initial views of the movement. She argues that the movement
remains effective in the midst of radical changes in activist movements. Breines also summarizes and
evaluates the new and growing scholarship on the 1960s. Her provocative analysis of the New Left remains
important today.
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From reader reviews:

Ida Vanwormer:

The book Community and Organization in the New Left, 1962-1968: The Great Refusal give you a sense of
feeling enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can being
your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem with the subject. If you can make reading a
book Community and Organization in the New Left, 1962-1968: The Great Refusal to be your habit, you can
get more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You are
able to know everything if you like start and read a book Community and Organization in the New Left,
1962-1968: The Great Refusal. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or
other individuals. So , how do you think about this reserve?

James Peterson:

As people who live in often the modest era should be update about what going on or facts even knowledge to
make these keep up with the era that is certainly always change and progress. Some of you maybe will
probably update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to
you is you don't know what one you should start with. This Community and Organization in the New Left,
1962-1968: The Great Refusal is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because
book serves what you want and need in this era.

Farah McCune:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider when those information which is inside the former life are difficult to be find than now is taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you understand it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you.
All those possibilities will not happen within you if you take Community and Organization in the New Left,
1962-1968: The Great Refusal as your daily resource information.

Kimberly Plummer:

Reading a book to get new life style in this season; every people loves to go through a book. When you study
a book you can get a lot of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you would like get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but
if you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and soon. The
Community and Organization in the New Left, 1962-1968: The Great Refusal provide you with a new
experience in studying a book.
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