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Written while Federico García Lorca was a student at Columbia University in 1929-30, Poet in New York is
one of the most important books Lorca produced, and certainly one of the most important books ever
published about New York City. Indeed, it is a book that changed the direction of poetry in both Spain and
the Americas, a pathbreaking and defining work of modern literature.

In honor of the poet's centenary, the celebrated Lorca scholar Christopher Maurer has revised this strange,
timeless, and vital book of verse, using much previously unavailable or untranslated material: Lorca's own
manuscript of the entire book; witty and insightful letters from the poet to his family describing his feelings
about America and his temporary home there (a dorm room in Columbia's John Jay Hall); the annotated
photographs which accompany those letters; and a prose poem missing from previous editions.
Complementing these new addtions are extensive notes and letters, revised versions of all the poems, and an
interpretive lectures by Lorca himself.

An excellent introduction to the work of one of the key figures of modern poetry, this bilingual edition of
Poet in New York is also a thrilling exposition of the American city in the 20th century.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Trejo:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important thing for
us to be aware of everything in the world. Each book has different aim or even goal; it means that e-book has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. These are reading
whatever they consider because their hobby is reading a book. How about the person who don't like reading
through a book? Sometime, person feel need book if they found difficult problem or exercise. Well, probably
you will want this Poet in New York (English and Spanish Edition).

Patricia Mattox:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Poet in New York (English and Spanish Edition)
was bright colored and of course has pictures around. As we know that book Poet in New York (English and
Spanish Edition) has many kinds or type. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Private
eye Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book usually are make
you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to
like reading that will.

Loren Benton:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by online on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is named
of book Poet in New York (English and Spanish Edition). You can include your knowledge by it. Without
departing the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most
crucial that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one destination for a other place.

Joseph Yancey:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is prepared or printed or descriptive from each source that will filled update of news.
Within this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social such as newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can
add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
searching for the Poet in New York (English and Spanish Edition) when you needed it?
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