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For the chocolate lover, there is nothing like biting into a rich, dark slice of chocolate cake. More than a
mouthful of something wonderful, it's a chocolate celebration. And nobody knows how to celebrate
chocolate cakes better than the "guru of ganache," chef Marcel Desaulniers.

In Death by Chocolate Cakes, Marcel serves up some of his most inventive, most sinful, most seductive
chocolate creations ever. His Chocolate Heart of Darkness cakes are the ultimate cupcakes. The secret--a
melted chocolate truffle center. For an unforgettable birthday cake, serve the one he created for Julia Child: a
ganache-covered chocolate almond cake with red raspberry mousse.

Have the desire for something that towers over ordinary chocolate desserts? Look up Excessively Expressive
Espresso Ecstasy or Chocolate Strawberry Teardrop Cake. These are exactly the things when "over the top"
is what you want. And for an elegant taste of Paris, try Marcel's Chocolate Pistachio Madeleines.

When you just can't wait for that chocolate fix, Marcel has plenty of quick-and-easy recipes, some of which
come from Marcel's mom's circle of chocolate-lover friends. Pour yourself a cold glass of milk and dig into
Margie's Golden Raisin Heavy Fudge Cake, Virginia's Cocoa Pound Cake with Warm Buttered Brandy
Berries, or Mimi Montano's Chocolate Zucchini Cake. As a bonus, there is a collection of ice creams, sauces,
beverages, and other delectables that are the perfect partners to Marcel's creations and an informative section
on equipment, ingredients, and techniques.

Death by Chocolate Cakes truly takes the cake and then takes it to where it's never been before.
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From reader reviews:

Tim Travers:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them friends and
family or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or
maybe playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different
you can read the book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the
entire day to reading a reserve. The book Death by Chocolate Cakes: An Astonishing Array of Chocolate
Enchantments it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. We were
holding enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy
typically the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not very
costly but this book provides high quality.

Deborah Lake:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with good friends is thing
that usually you might have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Death by Chocolate Cakes:
An Astonishing Array of Chocolate Enchantments, you can enjoy both. It is good combination right, you still
would like to miss it? What kind of hang type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't
understand it, oh come on its referred to as reading friends.

Samual Larkin:

You can spend your free time to study this book this guide. This Death by Chocolate Cakes: An Astonishing
Array of Chocolate Enchantments is simple to deliver you can read it in the playground, in the beach, train as
well as soon. If you did not include much space to bring the actual printed book, you can buy the actual e-
book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. Thus there are a
lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Dana Barker:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the
library or to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's spirit
or real their interest. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right
now there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring
and also can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important to suit your
needs. As we know that on this era, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways
to reach Chinese's country. So , this Death by Chocolate Cakes: An Astonishing Array of Chocolate
Enchantments can make you experience more interested to read.
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