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Love........................The Ultimate Loss of Control Rain and Raven Medici are identical twins. Although they
come from a loving close-knit family their childhoods couldn’t have been more different. Raven went to
school and was exposed freely to the outside world. Rain on the other hand was born with a blood disorder
and denied many normal childhood experiences. Once grown, Raven becomes a lawyer at their dad’s firm
Kane & Medici in NYC. Rain along with her only childhood friend Tommy Conte, builds a very successful
business as professional photographers. Traveling between Europe and Manhattan, and enjoying a world that
was kept from her, Rain vows never to be controlled again. Dominick Kane is a product of his upbringing.
He’s powerful, self-assured and knows he can achieve anything he desires. Nothing gets in his way. There is
only one thing he has ever failed at. A relationship with his father Vincent Kane. Upon his father’s death,
Dominick vows revenge. The events he sets in motion put him on ancollision course he himself will be
unable to control. In a bizarre twist of fate, Dominick kidnaps Raven as part of his plan for revenge. Only to
discover afterward, he has taken Rain by mistake. Rain knows she can never survive being confined again.
So she strikes a bargain with the devil and agrees to help Dominick get back what he feels rightly belongs to
him. His father’s share of Kane & Medici. Dominick decides to use the strong attraction growing between
Rain and himself to control her in every way imaginable. Too bad no one ever taught Dominick you can’t
control the heart. Nothing could have prepared him for the effect Rain would have on his. Will this plan of
revenge turn into unconditional love? Or will Dominick and Rain’s need for control ultimately destroy them
and any possibly chance for a real future together.......
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From reader reviews:

Tracy Painter:

Now a day people that Living in the era where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not call for people to be aware of each information they get. How a lot
more to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book.
Reading through a book can help people out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Miss Taken
book as this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this book hundred %
guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Michael Mitchell:

Reading a book tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world could share their idea.
Guides can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their reader with their story or perhaps
their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the data about
something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young ones,
there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on this planet always try to improve their
talent in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write for their book. One of them is this
Miss Taken.

Ronald Meyers:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family,
or their friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, going to beach, or picnic inside
park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to fill your
current free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book may be option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to
consider look for book, may be the guide untitled Miss Taken can be very good book to read. May be it
might be best activity to you.

Alicia Cain:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill even analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because all this time you only find
publication that need more time to be read. Miss Taken can be your answer since it can be read by an
individual who have those short extra time problems.
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