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Mahamudra is the basic meditation practice for many Tibetan Buddhists, particularly of the Kagyu tradition.
It is particularly adaptable for modern people, since it involves no rituals and can be incorporated into all
daily activities. Saraha's "Song for the King" is a short verse text from classical India that is a basis for the
tradition and is widely known in Tibetan Buddhist circles. It is often the basis for teachings given in the
West, but there is only one outdated translation of it in print, first published in 1969. Michele Martin has
produced a stellar new translation, which is accompanied by a commentary from the well-known teacher
Khenchen Thrangu Rinpoche, who is uniquely skilled and concerned with making this method of meditation
available to Westerners.

While pithy and accessible, the book easily stands up to academic scrutiny, and includes the original Tibetan
as well - making it ideal for the popular, scholarly, and Tibetan audiences all at once.
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From reader reviews:

Lisa Hegland:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the guide entitled A Song for the King: Saraha on Mahamudra Meditation. Try to face
the book A Song for the King: Saraha on Mahamudra Meditation as your close friend. It means that it can to
become your friend when you truly feel alone and beside those of course make you smarter than previously.
Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes you much more confidence because you can know
almost everything by the book. So , let me make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Sheila Kilburn:

Book will be written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can know everything you want by a reserve.
Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Adjacent to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A e-book A Song for the King: Saraha on
Mahamudra Meditation will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can
know about anything. But some of you think that will open or reading the book make you bored. It is not
make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you searching for best book or acceptable book
with you?

Harrison Colon:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive today, people have do
something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated the item for a while is
reading. Yes, by reading a publication your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand up than
other is high. For you who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this particular A Song for
the King: Saraha on Mahamudra Meditation book as beginning and daily reading e-book. Why, because this
book is more than just a book.

John Day:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got learners? We believe that that problem
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. And you
know that little person such as reading or as looking at become their hobby. You have to know that reading is
very important along with book as to be the point. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update regarding something by book. A
substantial number of sorts of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is actually A
Song for the King: Saraha on Mahamudra Meditation.
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