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In August 1917, at the height of the First World War, a small biplane landed on the makeshift flight deck of
HMS Furious - the first ever carrier landing in aviation history. This small act ushered in a new era. Two
decades later, when Britain stood on the brink of another World War, the Royal Navy had a small fleet of
aircraft carriers, with several more nearing completion. When war came the newly-formed Fleet Air Arm
would demonstrate that what it lacked in modern equipment, it made up for in skill and daring.

The first of these carriers were converted from existing ships. Then in 1938 HMS Ark Royal was launched -
Britain's first purpose built carrier. Its design set the standard for what was to come. The "Ark" was followed
by the highly successful Illustrious Class, and then by others whose design was modified in the light of
wartime experience. British fleet carriers had steel flight decks, and although smaller and able to carry less
aircraft that the carriers seen in the Pacific, they were better suited to conditions in European waters. It also
meant they were more resilient, and could shrug off damage that would cripple their American counterparts.

Over the next six years these British aircraft carriers would launch attacks against a major Italian naval base,
attack the Italian battle fleet on the high seas, and cripple the Bismarck, so that the battleships of the Home
Fleet could overtake her. They would also see service in every theatre of war, including the Pacific.
Inevitably, their success came at a price. Courageous, Eagle and Ark Royal were torpedoed by U-Boats,
Glorious was sunk by the guns of a German battlecruiser, and Hermes was lost to Japanese bombs. Most of
the rest of the carrier fleet were damaged to some extent during their service lives, but they survived and kept
on fighting.

This New Vanguard title tells the story of these remarkable warships, and reveals the secrets of their design,
how they operated, and above all, what they achieved.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Sanchez:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information presently can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a know-how or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider any
time those information which is inside former life are challenging be find than now is taking seriously which
one works to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource then
you understand it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities
will not happen inside you if you take British Aircraft Carriers 1939-45 (New Vanguard) as the daily
resource information.

Andrew Blanton:

The book with title British Aircraft Carriers 1939-45 (New Vanguard) has a lot of information that you can
discover it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. That book exist new understanding the
information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world now. That is important to
yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you in new era of the
syndication. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Ann Macdonald:

The reason why? Because this British Aircraft Carriers 1939-45 (New Vanguard) is an unordinary book that
the inside of the reserve waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will shock you with the secret this
inside. Reading this book close to it was fantastic author who also write the book in such amazing way
makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning entirely. So ,
it is good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This excellent book
will give you a lot of benefits than the other book include such as help improving your proficiency and your
critical thinking method. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I had been you I will go to the reserve
store hurriedly.

Catherine Gates:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside along with friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh,
think reading a book will surely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It alright you can have
the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like British Aircraft Carriers 1939-45
(New Vanguard) which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.
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