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Draya is at rock bottom. She’s flat broke, and with no steady paycheck, she’s about to get evicted in the
middle of winter. With no friends or family to turn to for help, all she can do is remain on the path she’s on
and hope that her happily ever after will come.

Enter Mr. Leo Ellis.

He’s rich, charismatic, and gorgeous- and he only has eyes for her. White men usually aren't her thing, but
something about this man just makes her mocha skin blush with heat every time she sees him.

He will stop at nothing until he has all of her- and he is not a man who is used to hearing the word no. In
order for that to happen, Draya will have to give up everything about her old life. As danger and scandals
plague them, she has to wonder: is a chance with this man worth the risk of sacrificing everything she’s
worked for?

Approximately 70,000 words.
PLEASE NOTE; This is the clean version: very limited language and no graphic sex scenes, although there
are a few brief steamy moments!
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From reader reviews:

Douglas Leverette:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students because they're still students or it for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't
want do that. You must know how great and also important the book Whirlwind: Sweet Version. All type of
book are you able to see on many options. You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Paul Kindig:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them
household or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or
perhaps playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that is look different
you can read the book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the entire
day to reading a publication. The book Whirlwind: Sweet Version it is extremely good to read. There are a
lot of individuals who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. If you did not
have enough space bringing this book you can buy the particular e-book. You can m0ore simply to read this
book from a smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book possesses high quality.

Robert Baxter:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside together with friends, fun activity together with
family or just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by looking at a
book. Ugh, do you consider reading a book really can hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It
alright you can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Whirlwind:
Sweet Version which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.

Harold Thompson:

You can obtain this Whirlwind: Sweet Version by visit the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or
reviewing it might to be your solve problem if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this
publication are various. Not only by simply written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by e-
book. In the modern era like now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what their problem.
Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to
arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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